
VENUE DATE TIME CELEBRATIONS AND INTENTIONS AND MEETINGS 

Parish Church Saturday 9th  7.30pm The Vigil of the Fourth Sunday of Lent: 

Peggy Conlon, Cullane, Ted & Beetie Hughes, Carrick &    

Teresa & Michael Hennigan, Currower  (Facebook Live) 

Parish Church Sunday 10th 10.30am The Fourth Sunday of Lent: People of the Parish  

Parish Church Monday 11th ———- NO MORNING MASS 

Fr. Peyton Centre Tuesday 12th 12.15pm Intentions of the Seniors Group (Facebook Live).  

Parish Church Wednesday 13th  9.30am John Joe Howley, Currower 

Parish Church Wednesday 13th 7.00pm Parish Adoration 7.00pm until 9.00pm 

Parish Church Thursday 14th 9.30am  

Fr. Peyton Centre Thursday 14th 12.00pm Rosary recited in the Oratory. All Welcome  

Parish Church Thursday 14th  7.00pm Celebration of Frist Penance 

Parish Church Friday 15th  7.00am  

Parish Church Friday 15th  7.30pm Stations of the Cross 

Parish Church Saturday 16th  10.00am Billy Kelly, Currower (Facebook Live).  

Parish Church Saturday 16th  7.30pm Vigil Mass for the Solemnity of St. Patrick’s Day 

Bridget & Lillian Mulherin, Manchester& Kilgellia 

Michael & Mary Ellen & Micky Hughes, Carrick 

Michael & Ellen Keenan, Mary Agnes Keenan, Leeds

(Facebook Live).  

Parish Church Sunday 17th 10.30am Mass for the Solemnity of St. Patrick’s Day 

NEWSLETTER 

Inspired by the Life and Work of the Venerable Patrick Peyton CSC, we 

the people of Attymass Parish strive to build a Community that is rooted 

in Gospel Values and is deeply committed to the Mission of Jesus. 

Parish Mission Statement 

MONTH OF MARCH 

CHURCH DIARY THIS WEEK  

NEWSLETTER ITEMS: Under  GDPR, the protection of your  personal data is impor tant to us. We are happy 

to include your notice in our Parish Bulletin, but please ensure that you have received the consent of any persons      

referenced before submitting a notice to us. Please submit items by Wednesday evening at 8pm, via email 

(attymassparish@achonrydiocese.org) if possible and please include your  contact details. Thank you. 

Newsletters are single use items. If you take one upon entering the Church, please bring it home do 

not  leave it in the seat as it will have to be thrown away.  

 
Fr. John Maloney 

Parochial Administrator 
Parish House and Office: 096-29990 

Parish Mobile: 085-2552984  

attymassparish@achonrydiocese.org 

Twitter: @AttymassParish 

Fr. Peyton Memorial Centre 
Opening Hours: Monday to Friday 

9.30am to 5.30pm.  

Phone 096 45374. 

St. Feichin’s National School 
Telephone 096-45076 

office@attymassns.ie.  

PARISH SAFE GUARDING 

www.achonrydiocese.org/

diocesan-policy 

PARISH REPRESENTATIVES 

Veronica Peyton & Hugh McHugh 



 
 
 
 

We remember in our prayers all those 
whose anniversaries occur around this 
time. May they rest in peace. 

A sincere thanks to all who have handed 
in their contributions (the weekly        
envelopes) for the support of the parish. 
Please know that your support is very 
much appreciated and not taken for  
granted. Fr John 

1.Please sanitise your hands as you enter 
the church. 
2. There is no room in the sacristy to             
accommodate people  Please wait in 
your seat if you wish to see Fr. John 

The Fr.. Peyton Centre opening Hours: 
are as follows Monday to Friday 9.30am-
5.30pm. Closed at Weekends and Public 
Holidays 

The Rosary is recited every Thursday in 
the Fr. Peyton Centre at 12 noon 

Parish Adoration every Wednesday  
evening from 7pm till 9pm. 

The Stations of the Cross will take place 
on a Friday evening during Lent at 
7.30pm. 

Early morning Mass will take place on  
the Friday’s of Lent at 7.00am. 

25 Card Game in Attymass Community 
Centre, starting Monday March 11th at 
8.30pm sharp. €5 per  person all are          
welcome..  

The Achonry Pioneers have organised a 
Mass and presentation of pins to those 
celebrating important anniversaries in the 
Fr. Peyton Centre, Attymass on Thursday 
14th March at 8pm, followed by           
refreshments. All are welcome to come 
and join in this celebration.  
 

The Parish Dance and Draw takes lace 
next Friday night in the Ocean Sands 
Hotel, Enniscrone. Doors open at 8.30pm 

Please keep in your prayers the children 
of second class Amelia, Cillian, David, 
James, James, Luke who will celebrate 
their First Penance on Thursday 14th 
March in the Parish Church 

Penance Service for the Fr. Peyton      
Cluster of Parishes will take place in St. 
Michael`s Church, Foxford at 8 p.m, 
Tuesday 19th March  Visiting priests will 
attend  
Thursday 21st March Confessions in 
Attymass Church and Bonniconlon 
Church from 8-9pm with a visiting priest 
will attend. 

ACCORD Catholic Marriage Care is    
currently recruiting volunteers to train as 
marriage preparation programme        
facilitators. If you have enthusiasm to be 
part of the Accord team in supporting 
couples preparing for the Sacrament of 
Marriage? Successful applicants will   
receive professional training. Please    
contact Aisling on 01-5053112 or by 
email to marriagepreparation@accord.ie.   

Want to learn a musical instrument i.e. tin 
whistle, keyboard, flute, accordion etc 
come to Craoibhín Ballina on Thursday 
afternoon from 2 pm to 3 pm to learn any 
instrument with music teacher Maria. 
Cost is €10 per class. Classes will run the 
7th, 14th, 21st & 28th of March. All are 
welcome. For more info or to book a 
place call the Centre on 0872785365. 
Craoibhín are having a St. Patrick's Day 
coffee morning in the Centre on Thursday 
March 14th from 11 am to 1 pm.         
Refreshments and raffle on the day.     
Music by Padraig Moran. Cost is €7 per 
person. Everyone is welcome. For more 
info call the Centre on 0872785365 

Congratulations to Neil Cruise, Foxford 
who won a jackpot of €446 in the Moy 
Davitts 50/50 draw last weekend . A huge 
thank you to everyone who  supported the 
draws, it is greatly appreciated. Tickets 
are available in the usual retail outlets and 
by clicking https://smartlotto.ie/Bohola-
moy-davitts 
 
 

Bonniconlon Drama Society are           
presenting their latest production ‘Strictly 
For The Birds’ a three act comedy by 
Sam Cree in the Grove Hall, Bonniconlon 
on Friday, Saturday  and Sunday the 
22nd, 23rd and 24th of March nightly at 
8pm. Doors open at 7.15 pm. Tickets on 
the door, Adults €12  

CANA Talks – "A Roadmap to           
Happiness" – T.F Royal Theatre,        
Castlebar – Friday 31st May, 8 pm. 6 
speakers plus Special Guests. Inspiration 
+ Entertainment. Each speaker has just 15 
minutes to inspire you (from a faith      
perspective)! Enjoy real-life stories,   
humour, inspiring talks, great visuals, 
music, + more. This is not a conference, 
but a show! Tickets €20 + booking fee @ 
www.ticketmaster.ie. Can pay cash at the 
door. www.canatalks.com  

Trócaire, with your support, has been 
working in Malawi for the last forty-eight 
years. Malita is the single mother of six 
children and her family’s story is        
unfortunately one that is typical in       
Malawi as they struggle every day with 
no direct access to clean water for the 
household. The effects of climate change 
have worsened this struggle, and their 
situation is even more precarious now, 
due to drought and extreme weather 
events.  

PLEASE PRAY FOR  

Dear Jesus, the Venerable Patrick Peyton 
devoted his priestly life to strengthening 
the families of the world by calling them 
to pray together everyday, especially the 
Rosary. His message is as important for 
us now as it was during his life on earth. 
We beg you, therefore, to hasten the day 
of his beatification, so that your faithful                 
people everywhere will remember his 
message that the family that prays      
together stays together, will imitate him 
in his devotion to your Mother and ours, 
and will be inspired by his holy life to 
draw ever closer to you with childlike 
confidence and love. Amen 

BEATIFICATION PRAYER 

SAFETY MEASURES 

MOY DAVITTS 

BONNINCONLON DRAMA 

OFFERTORY COLLECTIONS 

ROSARY 

STATIONS OF THE CROSS 

CRAOIBHIN, BALLINA 

PIONEER MASS 

FR. PEYTON CENTRE 

LENT 2024 

LENT / EASTER CONFESSIONS 

PARISH DANCE & DRAW  

PARISH MINISTRIES 

SATURDAY 16th March 2024 

Reader:  Tony Gallagher  

Eucharist:   Patsy Garrett 
 

 

SUNDAY 17th March 2024 

Reader:  Ann Timlin 

Eucharist:  Christine Tolan 

PARISH ADORATION 

COMMUNITY CENTRE 

FIRST PENANCE 

CANA TALKS 

TRÓCAIRE ACCORD 


