
VENUE DATE TIME CELEBRATIONS AND INTENTIONS AND MEETINGS 

Parish Church Saturday 4th  7.30pm The Vigil of the Solemnity of Pentecost 

Martin Keenan, Carrickmore, Omagh (Facebook Live) 

Parish Church Sunday 5th 10.30am The Solemnity of Pentecost of the Lord: People of the Parish 

Parish Church Monday 6th  9.30am The Blessed Virgin Mary, Mother of the Church 

Parish Church Tuesday 7th 12.15pm Intentions of the Seniors Group (Facebook Live).  

Parish Church Wednesday 8th  9.30am Special Intention 

Parish Church Thursday 9th  9.30am For World Peace and especially in the Ukraine  

Parish Church Friday 10th  7.30pm Elizabeth & George Loftus, Currower  

Alice & Tom Scanlon, Achill 

Parish Church Saturday 11th 11.00am Annie & Michael Moyles, daughter Anne, Ballymore & de-

ceased members of the Henry & Moyles Families  

(Facebook Live)* 

Parish Church Saturday 11h  7.30pm The Vigil of the Solemnity of The Most Holy Trinity: 

The Kelly Family, Ardrass (Facebook Live) 

Parish Church Sunday 12th 10.30am The Solemnity of The Most Holy Trinity: People of the Parish 

NEWSLETTER 

Inspired by the Life and Work of the Venerable Patrick Peyton CSC, we 

the people of Attymass Parish strive to build a Community that is rooted 

in Gospel Values and is deeply committed to the Mission of Jesus. 

Parish Mission Statement 

MONTH OF JUNE 

CHURCH DIARY THIS WEEK  

PARISH AND DIOCESAN SAFE GUARDING 

www.achonrydiocese.org/diocesan-policy 

PARISH REPRESENTATIVES 

Veronica Peyton and Padraic Walsh 

Fr. John Maloney 

Parochial Administrator 
Parish House and Office: 096-29990 

Parish Mobile: 085-2552984  

attymassparish@achonrydiocese.org 

www.attymassparish.org 

Twitter: @AttymassParish 

St. Feichin’s National School 
Telephone 096-45076 

office@attymassns.ie.  

Fr. Peyton Memorial Centre 
Opening Hours:  

Monday to Friday from 10am to 5pm 

If you need assistance please phone         

096 45374. . 

NEWSLETTER ITEMS: Under  GDPR, the protection of your  personal data is impor tant to us. We are happy 

to include your notice in our Parish Bulletin, but please ensure that you have received the consent of any persons      

referenced before submitting a notice to us. Please submit items by Wednesday evening at 8pm, via email 

(attymassparish@achonrydiocese.org) if possible and please include your  contact details. Thank you. 

The Parish Masses on Mondays, and Saturday evenings will be live-streamed on the Parish Facebook page 

and Parish webpage. Any other Masses are put online when requested will be marked by asterisks (*) in 

the Church diary above  

Newsletters are single use items. If you take one upon entering the Church, please bring it home do not  

leave it in the seat as it will have to be thrown away.  



 
 
 
 

We remember in our prayers all those 
whose anniversaries occur around this 
time and we also remember all who have 
passed away during the coronavirus    
pandemic. May they rest in peace. 

The amounts received in the Month of 
May: Envelopes: €2,088.50, Loose: 
€52.15, Candles:  €291.71, Covid-19: €20 
A sincere thanks to all who have handed 
in their contributions (the weekly        
envelopes) for the support of the parish. 
Please know that your support is very 
much appreciated and not taken for  
granted. Fr John 

1.Please sanitise your hands as you enter 
the church. 

2. People are encouraged to wear        
Face masks  

3. Holy Communion will be distributed 
into the hand only 

5. Newsletters are single use items. If you 
take one upon entering the Church, please 
bring it home – do not discard it.  

6. There is no room in the sacristy to             
accommodate people due to Covid-19 
regulations. Please wait in your seat if 
you wish to see me. Fr. John 

Invitation to ADORERS of the Blessed 
Sacrament and Holy Communion age 
children in Achonry Diocese: National 
Eucharistic Adoration Pilgrimage to 
Knock on Saturday 18th June         
(Corpus Christi weekend) See posters in 
your church and programme on 
www.eucharisticadoration.ie            
ALL WELCOME 

A general operative is required for the 
Bofield Bonniconlon CE scheme, If   
interested contact the Intreo office Ballina 
on 096 80500 Ref. Number 2224122 . 

An open information evening by SMART 
Recovery Ireland will take place in Vita 
House, Abbey Street, Roscommon on 
Friday 10th June at 7pm. SMART        
Recovery is a peer-led, mutual aid       
organisation that supports those who wish 
to change addictive behaviour. The open 
evening will be followed by weekly     
support group meetings to be held in Vita 
House. All are welcome. For more      

information, please contact Darren on                         
086 171 5334, email                              
info@smartrecovery.ie or  visit our       
website www.smartrcovey.ie. 

A Word of thanks…On the 16th of      
October, in response to Pope Francis’ 
invitation, we launched the Synodal    
Journey in our Diocese. Over the past 
number of months, I invited parishioners 
to respond to questions linked with their 
experience of the Church today. I was 
heartened by the responses that came 
back through written and online           
submission as well as those who attended 
the four Cluster area meetings. The     
responses have now been collated and a 
report has been written. It is available to 
view on www.achonrydiocese.org. The 
report has been submitted to the Synod 
Steering Committee and will form part of 
a national response which will be        
submitted to Rome. I wish to thank all 
who took the time to participate in any 
way. I express my deepest gratitude to the 
three members of the Diocesan Pastoral 
Leadership Team: Maeve Leheny, Bill 
Carthy and Fr. Eugene Duffy who put 
many hours into the process to see it 
come to fruition.   
Now that the report is complete and    
parishioners have expressed their views, 
it will be our task to reflect upon how we 
respond to some of the priorities that 
emerged.   I pray for the guidance of the 
Holy Spirit in our continued discernment. 
With warm wishes and every blessing, 
+Paul Dempsey, 
Bishop of Achonry.     

Priesthood in Achonry Diocese – Have 
you the courage to respond to God’s 
call?. Contact Our Vocations Director, Fr 
Paul Kivlehan, The Presbytery,            
Ballaghaderreen, Co. Roscommon. Tel. 
094 - 9860011, Mobile 087 - 3683535,    
E-mail pkivlehan@achonrydiocese.org or       
contact any local priest.  

Lough Derg Three Day Pilgrimage runs 
Wednesday 1st June until Monday15th 
August (Sat 13th August is final day to 
begin the Pilgrimage). Admission €80 | 
Booking advised | Concessions available 
for students, seniors and groups. All 
booking info, including organised parish 
groups available at www.loughderg.org, 
email info@loughderg.org or telephone 
071 9861518. Lough Derg, Pettigo, Co 
Donegal, F94 N289 

Scripture Summer School Thursday 16th 
– Saturday 18th June “Walking the     
Synodal Pathway together.” Facilitated 

by Mr. Sean Goan and Fr Kieran 
O'Mahony OSA. We are delighted to 
bring you this year's Scripture Summer 
School in association with Tarsus     
Scripture School. In order to facilitate 
people from all over the country and   
further afield, we are delighted to offer 
participants the option of taking part 
online or in-person. Beginning: Thursday, 
16 June at 9.30 am Finishing: Saturday, 
18 June at 1pm. Location (if attending     
in-person): St John's Welcome Centre, 
Knock Shrine. Booking fee €40 Bookings 
must be completed online at 
www.knockshrine.ie/scripture-summer
-school You will need to select the    
option to either attend online or in-person 
at the time of booking. 

Worldpriest Annual Global Rosary Relay 
for the Sanctification of Priests on Friday 
24th June. The Father. Peyton Centre will 
be reciting the Joyful Mysteries of the 
Rosary at 2.15pm. This will be         
broadcasted on the Father Peyton Centre 
Facebook page. The Worldpriest Annual 
Global Rosary Relay is organised by 
Worldpriest. For further information visit 
www.worldpriest.com or  email            
info.worldpriest@gmail.com 

Congratulations to Frank Reid who won a 
jackpot of €530 in the Moy Davitts 50/50 
draw last Saturday A huge thank you to 
everyone who supported last week's 
draw, it is greatly appreciated. Tickets are 
available in the usual retail outlets and by 
clicking https://smartlotto.ie/Bohola-moy
-davitts 

PLEASE PRAY FOR  

Dear Jesus, the Venerable Patrick Peyton 
devoted his priestly life to strengthening 
the families of the world by calling them 
to pray together everyday, especially the 
Rosary. His message is as important for 
us now as it was during his life on earth. 
We beg you, therefore, to hasten the day 
of his beatification, so that your faithful                 
people everywhere will remember his 
message that the family that prays      
together stays together, will imitate him 
in his devotion to your Mother and ours, 
and will be inspired by his holy life to 
draw ever closer to you with childlike 
confidence and love. Amen 

BEATIFICATION PRAYER 

OFFERTORY COLLECTIONS 

LOUGH DERG 

MOY DAVITTS 

SAFETY MEASURES 

WORLDPRIEST ROSARY 

SMART RECOVERY  

BISHOP PAUL SAYS THANKS 

PARISH MINISTRIES 

KNOCK SUMMER SCHOOL 

CE SCHEME VACANCY  

ADORATION PLIGRIMAGE 

SATURDAY 11th June 2022 

Reader:  Mary Lavelle 

Eucharist:  Martina Mulherin 
 

SUNDAY 12th June 2022 

Reader:  Pat Boyle 

Eucharist:  Hugh McHugh 

DIOCESAN PRIESTHOOD 


